OFFICIAL GAZETTE — GOVT. OF GOA

SERIES I No. 48

2ND MARCH, 2023

Office/Commercial Tax

Area X Rate = Cost

100 X 11000 = 1100000

Cost X R.V. = Annual Rateable Value
1100000 X 12% = 132000

Zone X 2 = 264000

Less 10% = 26400

Taxable Amount = 237600

Rate of Tax @10% = 23760 p.a.
Panaji. (Clen Madeira)
Commissioner.
V. No. AP-1302.
L X X J

Department of Home

Home—General Division

Notification
11/463/90-HD(G)/629

Read: Notification No. 11-14-96-HD(G)/4021
dated 5-8-2013 published in the
Official Gazette, Series I No. 38 dated
20-11-2013.

Whereas the Government of Goa has
notified the Goa Freedom Fighters Welfare
Rules, 2013 vide Notification 11-14-96-HD(G)/
/4021 dated 05-12-2013 to bestow certain
benefits to the Freedom Fighters of Goa
registered in the Home Department (General),
Secretariat, Porvorim-Goa, and whereas the
Government of Goa desires to amend these
rules as under to enhance the Financial
Assistance:

1. Short title and commencement.— (1)
These Rules may be called “The Goa Freedom
Fighters Welfare (Amendment) Rules, 2022".

(2) These shall come into force with effect
from 19-12-2022.

2. Amendment to Rule 4.— In Rule 4 of the
Goa Freedom Fighters Welfare Rules, 2013,
for the expression “Rs. 3500/- plus applicable
Dearness Allowances as per the rate

1624

announced by Central Government from time
to time”, the expression “Rs. 9000/- plus
applicable Dearness Allowance as per the
Order No. 8/1/2016-Fin(R&C)/(A) dated
30-11-2016 under 7th Pay Commission” shall
be substituted.

3. Amendment to Rule 5.— In Rule 5 of the
Goa Freedom Fighters Welfare Rules, 2013,
for the word and figure “Rs. 1000/-", the word
and figure “Rs. 3000/-" shall be substituted.

4. Amendment to Rule 6.— In Rule 6 of the
Goa Freedom Fighters Welfare Rules, 2013,
for the word and figure “Rs. 5,000/-", the
word and figure “Rs. 15,000/-" shall be
substituted.

5. Amendment to Rule 7.— In Rule 7 of the
Goa Freedom Fighters Welfare Rules, 2013,
for the word and figure “Rs. 25,000/-", the
word and figure “Rs. 50,000/-" shall be
substituted.

The enhanced benefits to the above rules
shall be effective from 19-12-2022.

This issues with the concurrence of the
Finance (Expenditure) Department, Government
of Goa, vide their U. O. No. 1400089984 dated
24-01-2023.

By order and in the name of the
Governor of Goa.

Vivek K. Naik, Under Secretary (Home-II).
Porvorim, 23rd February, 2023.
— %o
Department of Mines
Directorate of Mines & Geology
Notification
03/176/2022/Major/Mines/3173

In exercise of the powers conferred by
section 23C of the Mines and Minerals
(Development and Regulation) Act, 1957
(Central Act 67 of 1957) and all other powers
enabling it in this behalf, the Government of
Goa hereby makes the following rules, so as
to further amend the Goa (Prevention of



OFFICIAL GAZETTE — GOVT. OF GOA

SERIES I No. 48

2ND MARCH, 2023

Illegal Mining, Storage and Transportation of
Minerals) Rules, 2013, namely:—

1. Short title and commencement.— (1)
These rules may be called the Goa (Prevention
of Illegal Mining, Storage and Transportation
of Minerals) (Fifth Amendment) Rules, 2023.

(2) They shall come into force on the date
of their publication in the Official Gazette.

2. Amendment of rule 12.— In rule 12 of
the Goa (Prevention of Illegal Mining, Storage
and Transportation of Minerals) Rules, 2013
(hereinafter referred to as the “principal
Rules”),

(1) in sub-rule (1), after the word
“leaseholder”, the words “or exporter”
shall be inserted;

(if) in sub-rule (5), for the words “lease

holders”, the words “lease holders or
exporters” shall be substituted;

3. Amendment of rule 14.— In rule 14 of
the principal Rules, in sub-rule (1), for the
words “lease holder”, the words “leaseholder
or exporter” shall be substituted.

4. Amendment of rule 17— In rule 17 of
the principal Rules, in sub-rule (1), after the
word “leaseholder” the words “or exporter”
shall be inserted.

By order and in the name of the Governor
of Goa.

Dr. S. Shanbhogue, Director & ex officio Jt.
Secretary.

Panaji, 28th February, 2023.
2 2 22
Department of Public Health

Order
48/1/2019-1/PHD/277

Read: Order No. 48/1/2019-1/PHD/1146
dated 26-05-2021.

Sanction of the Government is hereby
conveyed for the creation of additional 89
posts for the upgraded South Goa District
Hospital, Margao under Directorate of Health
Services in various categories as under:-

Sr.  Name of the post Pay No. of posts
No. Level recommended
for creation
1. Sr. Surgeon Level-11 01
2. Jr. Surgeon Level-10 01
3. Sr. Pathologist Level-11 01
4. Jr. Pathologist Level-10 01
5. Sr. Respiratory Level-11 01
Chest Physician
6. Jr. Dermatologist Level-10 01
7. Jr. Gynecologist Level-10 02
8. Accounts Officer Level-10 01
9. Public Health Level-10 01
Dentist
10. Staff Nurse Level-6 63
11. Bio Medical Engineer Level-6 01
12. Pharmacist Level-5 04
13. Physiotherapist Level-5 02
14. Counselor Level-4 01
15. Laboratory Tech. Level-4 05
16. Blood Bank Tech. Level-4 01
17. Social Worker Level-4 02
Total 89 posts

The expenditure is debitable to the Demand
No. 48 of the respective Budget Head of
Account.

This issues with the recommendation of the
Administrative Reforms Department vide their
U. No. 47/F dated 15-07-2020, approval of the
Personnel Department vide their U. O. No.
3951/F dated 28-02-2021 and concurrence of
the Finance (Rev. & Cont.) Department vide
their U. O. No. 1400066839 dated 01-03-2021
and concurrence of the Finance (Rev. & Cont.)
Department vide their U. O. No. 1400066839
dated 12-02-2023.

This also issues with the approval of the
Council of Ministers as conveyed by
General Administration Department vide
letter No. 1/11/2021-GAD-II dated 24-05-2021.

This supersedes the earlier order dated
26-05-2021 read in preamble.
By order and in the name of the
Governor of Goa.

Gautami Parmekar,

(Health-II).
Porvorim, 22nd February, 2023.

Under Secretary

1625



